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Daniel 6:3-4 Now Daniel so distinguished himself among the administrators and the 
satraps by his exceptional qualities that the king planned to set him over the whole 
kingdom. 4 At this, the administrators and the satraps tried to find grounds for charges 
against Daniel in his conduct of government affairs, but they were unable to do so. They 
could find no corruption in him, because he was trustworthy and neither corrupt nor 
negligent. 

Psalm 57:4 I am in the midst of lions; I am forced to dwell among ravenous beasts— 
men whose teeth are spears and arrows, whose tongues are sharp swords. 

1 Peter 5:8 Be alert and of sober mind. Your enemy the devil prowls around like a roaring 
lion looking for someone to devour. 

The One Thing 

How I ________________ When I’m Attacked Is Largely Determined by 

_________ I Am ______________ the Attack. 

 

______________ Produces _____________________. 

 

Five Principles of Faith and Faithfulness: 
 

1.   The Greatest Threat to My Faithfulness Might Be My 

_________________ or My _______________________. 

 Daniel 6:10 Now when Daniel learned that the decree had been published, he went 
home to his upstairs room where the windows opened toward Jerusalem. Three times 
a day he got down on his knees and prayed, giving thanks to his God, just as he had 
done before. 

 
 



2.  I Am Sometimes Persecuted for What I ______________ to Do and 

Sometimes I Am Persecuted for What I ______________ to Do. 

Daniel 6:10  

Daniel 3:12 But there are some Jews whom you have set over the affairs of the province 
of Babylon—Shadrach, Meshach and Abednego—who pay no attention to you, Your 
Majesty. They neither serve your gods nor worship the image of gold you have set up.” 

Daniel 3:17-18 If we are thrown into the blazing furnace, the God we serve is able to 
deliver us from it, and he will deliver us from Your Majesty’s hand. 18 But even if he does 
not, we want you to know, Your Majesty, that we will not serve your gods or worship the 
image of gold you have set up.” 

 
 
 
 

3.   My Responsibility is to ___________ Jesus and Leave All of the 

________________________ to Him. 

 Daniel 6:10-17  
 
 
 

 

4.   Keep My Eyes on _____________ not on the _____________. 

Daniel 6:18-22 Then the king returned to his palace and spent the night without eating 
and without any entertainment being brought to him. And he could not sleep. 19 At the 
first light of dawn, the king got up and hurried to the lions’ den. 20 When he came near 
the den, he called to Daniel in an anguished voice, “Daniel, servant of the living God, has 
your God, whom you serve continually, been able to rescue you from the lions?” 21 Daniel 
answered, “May the king live forever! 22 My God sent his angel, and he shut the mouths 
of the lions. They have not hurt me, because I was found innocent in his sight. Nor have I 
ever done any wrong before you, Your Majesty.” 

 
 
 
 

5.   Faith and Faithfulness Open My Life to What _____________ Can Do, 

Not Just What _____ Can Do. 

 Daniel 6:23-28 
   

 


